
One fixture. Two light
zones. Three settings.
This slim, sleek black ceiling light is designed to compliment your

style. The sharp clean round lines of the main light are accented

with a subtle linear edge light. Both lights work together to create

three unique 2,700 k cool white light settings for a beautiful even

light effect. The lamp is available in three sizes, and therefore fits

perfectly in any room of your house. It is completed with a handy

memory feature that can recall your latest setting. The Ozziet

ceiling light looks as good off as it does on.

Designed for your living room and bedroom

• Perfect to relax and socialise

Match your interior

• Super slim design

Easy to experience

• Memorise your favourite mode for easy selection

• Easy installation

Light effect

• Dual zone light

Ceiling light

Functional

Ozziet CL570

Black

Dim

8719514432086



Highlights
Perfect to relax and socialise
The living room is the heart of any
home: a place where families gather to
relax and guests socialise. Lighting for
your living room and bedroom has to
be flexible and easy to adjust to its
different uses throughout the day.
Careful placement of different light
sources and playing with light layering
helps create the feeling of space and
gives the room a warm and welcoming
feel.

Super slim design
Slim design is ideal for low-ceiling
rooms, sitting flush against the surface.

Memorise your favourite mode for
easy selection
Whether you prefer a warm glow for
cosy evenings or a bright white light for
focus, the system memorises your
favourites for easy selection.

Easy installation
No more hassle with installation. Just
fix or hang securely on the wall or
ceiling, and plug it in. Your new light
fitting is now ready to light up your
room!

Dual zone light
Changing the ambiance in your room
has never been easier. Philips'
SceneSwitch Dual zone LED ceiling
light lets you set the mood with three
unique settings. The combination of
main and linear edge light give you
options that are perfect for your get
together, concentrating and cosy
moments. No dimmer or installation
required – all you need is your existing
switch.

Specifications
Bulb characteristics

• Intended use: Indoor

Design and finishing

• Colour: Black

• Material: plastic

Durability

• Number of switch cycles: 20,000

Extra feature/accessory incl.

• Adjustable spot head: No

• Dimmable with remote control: No

• LED integrated: Yes

• Remote control included: No

Light characteristics

• Colour consistency: 6 SDCM

• Colour rendering index (CRI): 80

Miscellaneous

• Especially designed for: Kitchen

• Style: Contemporary

• Type: Ceiling light

• EyeComfort: Yes

Other characteristics

• Lamp current: 180 mA

• Efficacy: 108 lm/W

Product dimensions and weight

• Net weight: 1.55 kg

• Height: 5.5 cm

• Length: 50 cm

• Width: 50 cm

Service

• Warranty: 5 year(s)

Technical specifications

• Lifetime up to: 20,000 h

• Diameter: 500 mm

• Total lumen output fixture: 3900

• Light colour: 2700

• Fixture dimmable: Step Dim – Do not
use with dimmer

• LED: Yes

• Wattage bulb included: 36

• IP code: IP20

• Class of protection: Class II

Packaging dimensions and weight

• EAN/UPC - product: 8719514432086

• Net weight: 1.55 kg

• Gross weight: 2.15 kg

• Height: 52.8 cm

• Length: 5.9 cm

• Width: 52.5 cm

• Material number (12NC):
929003197001
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