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Signify on track to double its positive impact on the environment and society as part of its 
Brighter Lives, Better World 2025 sustainability program 

 
• On course to deliver against ambitious goal of doubling pace of Paris Agreement’s 1.5ᵒ scenario 

• Generated 29% Circular revenues and 27% Brighter lives revenues 

• Increased the percentage of women in leadership to 28% 
 
Eindhoven, the Netherlands – Signify (Euronext: LIGHT), the world leader in lighting, has made 
significant progress towards the targets of its Brighter Lives, Better World 2025 sustainability 
program. At the end of the program’s second year, Signify is on its way to doubling its positive impact 
on the environment and society. At the same time, it remained carbon neutral in its operations and 
continued the use of 100% renewable electricity. 
 
Having reduced its operational carbon footprint by more than 70% over the last decade, Signify 
ramped up its efforts in 2022, not just in operations, but across the entire value chain, to minimize 
the impact of climate change. At the end of 2022, the company is on track to deliver against the 
ambitious goal of doubling the pace of the Paris Agreement’s 1.5ᵒ scenario by the end of 2025 across 
all Scopes.  
 
Increasing Circular revenues to 29% of global revenues and Brighter lives revenues to 27% is a 
significant step towards the target of 32% for both revenue streams by the end of 2025. For Circular 
revenues, this positive trend is driven by serviceable and circular luminaires. The Brighter lives 
revenues benefitted from a strong contribution from the consumer well-being and safety & security 
portfolios.  
 
At the same time, Signify increased the percentage of women in leadership to 28%, an improvement 
versus the end of 2021, yet slightly off track to reach its 2025 target of 34%. We will continue our 
effort to improve diversity at all levels, attracting candidates from more diverse pipelines and driving 
development and internal mobility to increase representation across our company.  
 
“The goals of our Brighter Lives, Better World 2025 program are ambitious, so I’m proud of how 
much progress we’ve made at the end of the program’s second year,” said Maurice Loosschilder, 
Head of Sustainability at Signify. “We need to address the important social and environmental 
challenges of our time, by looking beyond our own operations to increase our positive impact across 
our entire value chain.”  
 
 Additional highlights include: 

• Climate action revenues of 65% 

• Zero manufacturing waste to landfill  

• 8.3 million lives lit through the Signify Foundation since 2017 

• Safe and healthy workplace with a Total Recordable Case rate of 0.16 

• Supplier sustainability performance rate of 94% 
 

http://www.signify.com/
https://www.signify.com/global/sustainability/brighter-lives-better-world


 

 

As recognition of its progress, Signify featured in the Dow Jones Sustainability World Index for the 
sixth consecutive year since our IPO. Signify was also included in CDP’s 2022 ‘Climate A list’ for 
reducing its own environmental impact. Additional recognition for the company’s sustainability 
leadership came from Sustainalytics, Euronext Benelux 20, VBDO, MSCI, EcoVadis and EquiLeap. 
 
For more details on Signify’s sustainability performance, visit the website or download the Signify 
Annual Report 2022.  https://www.signify.com/global/our-company/investors/financial-
reports/annual-report 
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About Signify 
Signify (Euronext: LIGHT) is the world leader in lighting for professionals and consumers and lighting 
for the Internet of Things. Our Philips products, Interact connected lighting systems and data-enabled 
services, deliver business value and transform life in homes, buildings and public spaces. In 2022, we 
had sales of EUR 7.5 billion, approximately 35,000 employees and a presence in over 70 countries. 
We unlock the extraordinary potential of light for brighter lives and a better world. We achieved 
carbon neutrality in our operations in 2020, have been in the Dow Jones Sustainability World Index 
since our IPO for six consecutive years and were named Industry Leader in 2017, 2018 and 2019. 
News from Signify is located at the Newsroom, Twitter, LinkedIn and Instagram. Information for 
investors can be found on the Investor Relations page.  
 

https://www.signify.com/global/our-company/news/press-releases/2022/20221212-signify-is-a-member-of-the-dow-jones-sustainability-world-index-for-sixth-consecutive-year
https://www.globenewswire.com/Tracker?data=JHh9YMmhJA3nvUxfN1RwIYUHhjTWJpn9R3MZvl_FWIusH90jix5HVbK-N9oZOgX8q-kktLGO0-eFh4pjR45sgPb5fEOrzUODjhhhCQdDUWmX_gJ-JLQZMA084MjqQX6G
https://www.signify.com/global/our-company/investors/financial-reports/annual-report
https://www.signify.com/global/our-company/investors/financial-reports/annual-report
mailto:elco.van.groningen@signify.com
mailto:elco.van.groningen@signify.com
https://www.signify.com/
https://www.lighting.philips.com/
https://www.interact-lighting.com/en
https://www.signify.com/global/our-company/news/press-releases/2020/20200908-signify-achieves-carbon-neutrality-and-sets-course-to-double-its-positive-impact-on-the-environment-and-society
https://www.signify.com/global/sustainability
https://www.spglobal.com/spdji/en/indices/esg/dow-jones-sustainability-world-index/#overview
https://www.signify.com/global/our-company/news/press-releases/2019/20190916-signify-named-industry-leader-in-2019-dow-jones-sustainability-index
https://www.signify.com/global/our-company/news/press-release-archive/2017/20170907-philips-lighting-named-industry-leader-in-the-2017-dow-jones-sustainability-index
https://www.signify.com/global/our-company/news/press-releases/2018/20180913-signify-named-industry-leader-2018-dow-jones-sustainability-index
https://www.signify.com/global/our-company/news/press-releases/2019/20190916-signify-named-industry-leader-in-2019-dow-jones-sustainability-index
https://www.signify.com/news
https://twitter.com/Signifycompany
https://www.linkedin.com/company/signifycompany/mycompany/
https://www.instagram.com/signifycompany/
https://www.signify.com/investors
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