
Light and relaxed
Philips myLiving Decolinea Trunk LED batten cove light is all about

performance. Shadow free and connectable up to 12 pieces at a

time. Available in 4 lengths and up to 15,000 hours usage, it is the

ideal replacement of the T5 batten.

Easy installation

• Easy installation

Long lifespan

• Extremely long life 20,000 hours

Energy saving

• Built-in LED, as part of the system

Wall light

Linea

31095 TrunkLinea 7W 4000K

white

LED
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Highlights
Easy installation

No more hassle in installation. Just fix
or hang securely on the wall and plug
in, now this luminaire is ready to light
on.

Extremely long life

A light source you can trust. Philips
LED lights offer an extremely long-life
of at least 20,000 hours (which equals
20 years on basis of an average use of
3 hours / day with an amount of at
least of 13,000 on/off switching
cycles). It feels so comfortable to think
that you won't have to worry about
maintenance or lamp replacement

while having the perfect light ambiance
in your home.

Integrated LED light source

A light source you can trust. With
integrated LED light source, you won't
have to worry about maintenance or
lamp replacement while having the
perfect light ambiance in your home.

Specifications
Design and finishing

• Color: White

• Material: Synthetic

Durability

• Nominal lifetime: 15,000

Extra feature/accessory incl.

• Diffused light effect: Yes

• LED integrated: Yes

Miscellaneous

• Especially designed for: Living- &
Bedroom, Home office & Study

• Style: Contemporary

• Type: Wall Lights

• EyeComfort: No

Product dimensions and weight

• Net weight: 0.145 kg

• Height: 3.6 cm

• Length: 58.4 cm

• Width: 2.2 cm

Service

• Warranty: 1 year(s)

Technical specifications

• Total lumen output fixture: 500 lm

• Mains power: Range 220 V - 240 V,
50-60 Hz

• Wattage bulb included: 6 W

• IP code: IP20, protection against
objects bigger than 12.5 mm, no
protection against water

• Class of protection: Class II - Double
Insulated

• Number of light sources: 1

Packaging dimensions and weight

• EAN/UPC - product: 6947830426348

• Net weight: 0.14 kg

• Gross weight: 0.18 kg

• Height: 24 mm

• Length: 38 mm

• Width: 590 mm
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